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Abstract 

Patella cubiti is a very rare anomaly characterized by the non-union of the olecranon with the proximal ulna. We report 
the case of a 35-year-old patient admitted for an elbow trauma, initially misdiagnosed as an olecranon fracture. The 
patient underwent surgical resection of the bone fragment. Six months postoperatively, he was satisfied with the 
outcome, as the foreign body sensation in his elbow had completely resolved.  
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1. Introduction

Patella cubiti is an extremely rare congenital or developmental anomaly characterized by the non-union of the 
olecranon with the proximal ulna. This condition, often asymptomatic, may be incidentally discovered on radiographs 
or misdiagnosed as an olecranon fracture, especially in cases of trauma. Due to its rarity, there is limited literature on 
its clinical presentation, diagnosis, and management. When symptomatic, patients may experience pain, mechanical 
discomfort, or functional limitations, necessitating surgical intervention. 

In this article, we present a rare case of patella cubiti in a 35-year-old patient, initially mistaken for an olecranon 
fracture, and discuss the diagnostic challenges and therapeutic options based on a review of the literature.  

2. Patient and observation

This was a 35-year-old patient with no particular medical history and no profession, admitted to our facility for the 
management of a closed trauma to the left elbow following an assault with a baton. Before the trauma, the patient had 
noticed a firm, painless mass on the posterior aspect of the left elbow, distinct from the olecranon. This asymptomatic 
mass had not been previously investigated. 

On clinical examination of the left elbow, we noted bruising on the posterolateral aspect of the elbow, with no vascular 
or nerve damage and no impairment of elbow mobility. Frontal and lateral X-rays of the left elbow revealed a bony 
fragment with regular edges near the olecranon (Figure 1). A diagnosis of an olecranon fracture was made, and surgical 
intervention was indicated. 

The patient was placed in the lateral decubitus position with the arm in a cross-body position. Through a posterior 
approach to the elbow, exploration revealed an intact triceps tendon with a rounded, regular bony fragment located 
approximately 3 cm from the tip of the olecranon, embedded within the tendon, resembling the anatomy of the patella 
(Figure 2). This bony fragment was resected at the patient's request. 
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At the 6-month follow-up, the patient reported no complaints or functional impairment of the elbow. 

 

Figure 1 X-ray of the elbow from the front and side showing the appearance of patella cubiti 

 

 

Figure 2 Intraoperative image: A) highlighting of the patella cubiti; B) release of the bone fragment into the triceps 
tendon; C) bone fragment of the patella cubiti 
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3. Discussion 

Patella cubiti is an extremely rare congenital or developmental anomaly characterized by the presence of an accessory 
bone in the posterior aspect of the elbow, typically embedded in the triceps tendon. It is often asymptomatic and 
discovered incidentally on imaging or during surgery for an unrelated condition. Given its rarity, the exact prevalence 
remains unknown, and most of the available literature consists of isolated case reports and small case series [1,2]. 

The etiology of patella cubiti remains unclear. Some authors suggest it results from a failure of fusion of secondary 
ossification centers of the olecranon, while others propose a post-traumatic or repetitive microtrauma origin [3,4]. The 
presence of a well-defined, regular bone fragment embedded within the triceps tendon, as observed in our case, 
supports the theory of an accessory ossification center rather than a post-traumatic sequela. 

Patients with patella cubiti are usually asymptomatic, but in some cases, they may report localized pain, swelling, or 
mechanical discomfort, particularly during elbow extension. In traumatic settings, the presence of an ossified structure 
near the olecranon can be misdiagnosed as an olecranon fracture, leading to unnecessary surgical intervention [5]. In 
our case, the patient had a history of a firm, painless mass in the posterior elbow, which had not been previously 
investigated. The condition was initially mistaken for a fracture, highlighting the diagnostic challenges associated with 
this anomaly. 

Radiographic evaluation plays a crucial role in differentiating patella cubiti from an acute fracture. Characteristic 
findings include a well-corticated, smoothly margined bone fragment near the olecranon, which contrasts with the 
irregular and jagged edges typical of traumatic fractures [6]. However, in the absence of prior imaging, differentiation 
from an old, non-united fracture or heterotopic ossification can be challenging. 

The management of patella cubiti depends on the patient’s symptoms. Asymptomatic cases do not require treatment 
and can be managed conservatively. However, in symptomatic cases, particularly when there is pain, limited range of 
motion, or mechanical symptoms, surgical excision of the accessory bone is an option [7]. 

In our case, the patient opted for surgical resection due to discomfort. At the 6-month follow-up, he reported no 
functional impairment, consistent with previous reports that suggest a good prognosis after surgical removal of the 
ossified fragment [8].  

4. Conclusion 

Patella cubiti is a rare but important differential diagnosis of olecranon fractures, particularly in trauma settings. 
Awareness of this condition can prevent misdiagnosis and unnecessary surgical interventions. When symptomatic, 
surgical resection provides excellent outcomes with no significant impact on elbow function. Further studies and case 
reports are needed to better understand the natural history and optimal management of this anomaly.  
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